
      

 

 

 
Emerging Developing Secure Excellence 

Memory 
Recall 

Knowledge recall questions will be 
assessed as one mark questions 
(command words: identify, state, 
define, draw) on assessments and 
through ROCK tests that are 
undertaken twice per term reviewing 
Core Knowledge taught in the unit of 
study. All Core knowledge is 
displayed on students’ Knowledge 
Organiser  glued into the front of 
exercise books. This will be recorded 
on each PLC. Emerging = Less than 
10% 

Knowledge recall questions will be 
assessed as one mark questions 
(command words: identify, state, 
define, draw) on assessments and 
through ROCK tests that are 
undertaken twice per term reviewing 
Core Knowledge taught in the unit of 
study. All Core knowledge is 
displayed on students’ Knowledge 
Organiser  glued into the front of 
exercise books. This will be recorded 
on each PLC. Developing 10-39% 

Knowledge recall questions will be 
assessed as one mark questions 
(command words: identify, state, 
define, draw) on assessments and 
through ROCK tests that are 
undertaken twice per term reviewing 
Core Knowledge taught in the unit of 
study. All Core knowledge is 
displayed on students’ Knowledge 
Organiser  glued into the front of 
exercise books. This will be recorded 
on each PLC. Secure = 40-69% 

Knowledge recall questions will be 
assessed as one mark questions 
(command words: identify, state, 
define, draw) on assessments and 
through ROCK tests that are 
undertaken twice per term reviewing 
Core Knowledge taught in the unit of 
study. All Core knowledge is 
displayed on students’ Knowledge 
Organiser  glued into the front of 
exercise books. This will be recorded 
on each PLC. Excellence = more than 
70% 

Literacy 

 No religious key terms used or 
used accurately 

 

 Some religious key terms may be 
used: 

       Monotheism; polytheism Trinity; 
Trimurti; omni’s; worship; deity; 
mythology; Pascal’s wager 

 

 Use min. 3 religious key terms: 
     Monotheism; polytheism Trinity; 

Trimurti; omni’s; worship; deity; 
mythology; Pascal’s wager 

 

 Use min. 6 religious key terms: 
        Monotheism; polytheism Trinity; 

Trimurti; omni’s; worship; deity; 
mythology; Pascal’s wager 

Learning 
About 

Religion 

 One or more viewpoints asserted 
but not described 

 Describe 2 or more viewpoints 
with justification these may at 
times be described rather than 
explained fully 

 Use a quotation appropriately e.g. 
Genesis or tell the story 

 Explain 2 or more viewpoints with 
justification – these may at times 
be described rather than explained 
fully 

 Use a quotation appropriately e.g. 
Genesis and explain its meaning 

  Explain 2 or more viewpoints with 
justification 

 

Explanation 

 Beliefs are listed but not described 
with no evidence/ justification 

 Describe 1 or more religious 
viewpoints about God -this may 
be described at times 

 Explain more than 1 religious 
viewpoints about God using 
evidence – this may be described 
at times 

 Explain more than 1 religious 
viewpoints about God using 
evidence 

 Explain Philosopher’s arguments 
e.g. Blaise Pascal 
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